
    
 
 

Beginner 
 
7:15 am ..........  Registration 
7:50 am ..........  Warm Up 
      
8:00 am .......... MUSIC THEATRE 
     with Michelle Elkin 
 
9:00 am .......... HIP HOP 
     with Anthony Lofendo 
 
10:00 am ........ TAP 
     with Shelly Butcher 
 
11:00 am ........ LYRICAL 
     with Matt Brekke 
 
12:00 pm...Scholarships Awarded 
                   followed by Dismissal 
 

Intermediate 
 
7:15 am .........  Registration 
7:50 am .........  Warm Up 
 
8:00 am ......... JAZZ 
     with Helene Phillips 
 
9:00 am ......... LYRICAL 
     with Andrew and Missy 
 
10:00 am ....... BALLET 
     with Matt Brekke 
 
11:00 am ....... MUSIC THEATRE 
     with Michelle Elkin 
 
12:00 pm ....... Lunch Break 
 
1:00 pm ......... JAZZ 
     with Helene Phillips 
 
2:00 pm ......... MUSIC THEATRE 
     with Michelle Elkin 
 
3:00 pm……..HIP HOP 
     with Anthony Lofendo 
 
4:00 pm ......... CONTEMPORARY 
     with Andrew and Missy 
 
5:00 pm... Scholarships Awarded 
                 followed by Dismissal 
 
  

Advanced 
 
7:15 am ..........  Registration 
7:50 am ..........  Warm Up 
 
8:00 am…..CONTEMPORARY 
     with Andrew and Missy 
 
9:00 am…….MUSIC THEATRE 
     with Michelle Elkin 
 
10:00 am ..... JAZZ 
     with Helene Phillips 
 
11:00 am ..... HIP HOP 
     with Anthony Lofendo 
 
12:00 pm ........ Lunch Break 
 
1:00 pm .......... LYRICAL 
     with Andrew and Missy 
 
2:00 pm ……. BALLET 
     with Matt Brekke 
 
3:00 pm .......... JAZZ 
     with Helene Phillips 
 
4:00 pm……JAZZ SWING 
     with Michelle Elkin 
 
5:00 pm .......... HIP HOP 
     with Anthony Lofendo 
 
6:00 pm… Scholarships Awarded
                  followed by Dismissal  

 

 

 

 Intro to “Taking Shape 
Leadership Program” 

 

 

4:00 pm with Tracey Wozny 
 

 

Taking Shape is a youth leadership 
curriculum with a mission of 
creating young leaders. The 
program is designed to develop 
strong core character values in 
dancers and equip them with life 
skills needed to succeed beyond 
high school or college. Leadership 
components include a training 
student assistants module and a 
continuing education dance 
pathway partnership between the 
dance family and the studio. Come 
learn more and enjoy an open 
discussion on tips to grow young 
leaders in your studio! Open to 
studio teachers and parents alike. 
No registration required or class 
bracelets needed. This special 
presentation will take place in the 
Beginner room. 
 

 

TEACHING 
CONTEMPORARY 

 

3:00 pm with Andrew & Missy
 
 

Open to studio owners and 
teachers. It is also an optional 
class open to advanced student 
teachers who are 15 or older. 
Come ready to get on the floor and 
participate (or hang out and 
observe if you prefer). Class will be 
held in the Beginner/Tap room. 

OPTIONAL 
TAP CLASSES 

 

1:00 pm .... ADVANCED TAP 
      with Shelly Butcher 
 
2:00 pm .... INTERMEDIATE TAP 
      with Shelly Butcher 
 

Afternoon tap classes will be held 
in the Beginner room. 


